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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI751628490 

Date 14/10/2025 

 
Waste Bin Collections 
 
Request Time Period: From 1/1/25 to 1/8/25 
 
 

Information Requested Response  

It was very good to hear the Cabinet member state that the council are looking to 

improve the collection of bins on the correct day. To be able to improve there 

must already be measures in place  

With that in mind from January 1st 2025 until August 1st 2025 

1. What % of black bins were 

emptied on time in full ? 

98.08% 

2. What % of blue bins were 

emptied on time in full ? 

97.97% 

3. What % of brown bins were 

emptied on time in full ? 

93.57% 

4By ward, what % of black bins 

were emptied on time in full 

Information not held 

5.By ward what % of blue bins 

were emptied on time in full ? 

Information not held 

6. By ward, what % of brown bins 

were emptied on time in full ? 

Information not held 

7. What were the overtime 

payment costs to collect missed 

bins during that period ? 

£20,400.71 

8. In what time scale are you 

expecting to get the figures given 

to improve to 90% ( there will 

always be some missed due to 

issues beyond your control ? 

Collections are routinely made on schedule - 

typically the success rate is much higher than 

90%. Brown bins fell below 90% in July.  

Since then we have actively reviewed our 

recruitment processes and strengthened the 

management of both internal and external 

staffing requirements, as well as working 
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closely with the Neighbourhoods Team to 

address issues of blocked access, to mitigate 

against service disruption and improve 

reliability. 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

