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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI014380351 

Date 11/09/2025 

 

21/8/25 Applicant clarification: 

Q1. External provision vs DCC (internal provision) 
 

Information Requested Response  

1.How many children and young 

people are currently placed in; 

a)External Supported 

Accommodation 

Information as of 21/08/25:  

                                                                                       

53 

b)Internal Supported 

Accommodation 

Information as of 09/09/25: 

21 

c)External Residential 43 

d)Internal Residential 13 

2.Are placements made via a 

frameworks or spot purchasing? 

If frameworks are used, what are 

they called and when do they 

reopen for tender? Who is the 

main point of contact for each 

framework? 

Derby City Council by and large commissions 

supported accommodation placements via our 

Block contracting arrangements or via the 

D2N2 Supported Accommodation Framework 

so are unlikely to procure placements with off 

contract providers.  

• Derby City Council Supported 

Accommodation Block Contract –  

will not be reopened. 

 

• D2N2 Supported Accommodation 

Framework – there is a possibility this 

will be reopened in Autumn 2026 

although this has yet to be determined. 

The point of contact for both contracts is Kerry 

Eames, Senior Commissioning Project Officer.  
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3.Please confirm the average 

weekly cost in the previous 

financial year for the following: 

a)      Residential 

 

 

£5,329 per week 

b)      Supported Accommodation £600 per week 

c)      Floating Support 

21/8/25 Applicant clarification: 

In reference to c) floating support, 

this relates to young people who 

are accommodated by children's 

social care whereby there is not 

24/7 staff support in place. For 

example, a young person residing 

in supported accommodation 

where staffing support may be 5 

hours per week and they visit the 

home but to do not sleep in. 

Information not held 

d)Family Assessment 

In reference to d) family 

assessment, this relates to early 

help to support families to stay 

together where there are 

concerns for parents’ ability to 

look after or safeguard their 

children, or, support provided to 

families during pre-court 

proceedings. 

Information not held 

4.Please confirm the contact 

details (name, email, telephone 

number) of each person 

responsible for the 

commissioning of; 

a)Residential 

Celine Cowley, People’s Brokerage Manager 

Tel: 01332 642584 

celine.cowley@derby.gov.uk  

b)Supported Accommodation Kerry Eames, Senior Commissioning Project 

Officer 

mailto:celine.cowley@derby.gov.uk
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Tel: 01332 643514 

kerry.eames@derby.gov.uk  

c)Floating Support 

21/8/25 Applicant clarification: 

In reference to floating support, 

this relates to young people who 

are accommodated by children's 

social care whereby there is not 

24/7 staff support in place. For 

example, a young person residing 

in supported accommodation 

where staffing support may be 5 

hours per week and they visit the 

home but to do not sleep in. 

Kerry Eames, Senior Commissioning Project 

Officer 

Tel: 01332 643514 

kerry.eames@derby.gov.uk 

d)Family Assessment 

In reference to family 

assessment, this relates to early 

help to support families to stay 

together where there are 

concerns for parents’ ability to 

look after or safeguard their 

children, or, support provided to 

families during pre-court 

proceedings. 

Lorraine Smith, Commissioning Manager Early 

Help and Children’s Social Care 

Tel: 01332 256262 

lorraine.smith2@derby.gov.uk  

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

mailto:kerry.eames@derby.gov.uk
mailto:kerry.eames@derby.gov.uk
mailto:lorraine.smith2@derby.gov.uk
http://www.ico.org.uk/
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