

Derby City Council – Response
ID Reference FOI507136540
Date 10/07/2025

Information Requested	Response
1) Does the council collect data on how many of its residents are living full-time in a caravan?	Information not held
2) If yes, what is the most recent data on how many such residents there are? Please specify the time period for which this figure applies, and any relevant detail on how it was calculated – eg. is it number of residents or number of households?	Information not held
3) Is it known what proportion of caravan dwellers are from Gypsy or Traveller communities? If yes, please specify the proportion.	Information not held
4) If data is not formally collected on residents living full-time in a caravan, is the council aware of whether there are any such residents locally?	Information not held

<p>5) Has the council ever used caravans to temporarily accommodate people who would otherwise be homeless? If so, how many people are currently housed in this way?</p>	<p>The Council does not hold the information requested but it may be held by another organisation Derby Homes Limited.</p> <p>Please therefore re-send your request Derby Homes Limited directly using the following contact details:</p> <p>Derby Homes - Fol <a href="mailto:Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org">Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org</a></p> <p>The telephone number is: 01332 888777</p> <p>Derby Homes website request form found at: <a href="https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5">https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5</a></p>
<p>6) Does the council have strategic plans which incorporate the use of caravans as temporary accommodation?</p>	<p>The Council does not hold the information requested but it may be held by another organisation Derby Homes Limited.</p> <p>Please therefore re-send your request Derby Homes Limited directly using the following contact details:</p> <p>Derby Homes - Fol <a href="mailto:Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org">Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org</a></p> <p>The telephone number is: 01332 888777</p> <p>Derby Homes website request form found at: <a href="https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5">https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5</a></p>
<p>7) Is the council taking any actions to assure itself of the electrical safety of caravans being used as dwellings? If yes, please briefly detail the types of actions being taken.</p>	<p>The Council does not hold the information requested but it may be held by another organisation Derby Homes Limited.</p> <p>Please therefore re-send your request Derby Homes Limited directly using the following contact details:</p> <p>Derby Homes - Fol <a href="mailto:Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org">Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org</a></p> <p>The telephone number is: 01332 888777</p> <p>Derby Homes website request form found at: <a href="https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5">https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5</a></p>



<p>8) In the past 12 months, has the council offered caravan dwellers any specific advice or support on electrical safety in their vehicle?</p>	<p>The Council does not hold the information requested but it may be held by another organisation Derby Homes Limited.</p> <p>Please therefore re-send your request Derby Homes Limited directly using the following contact details:</p> <p>Derby Homes - Fol <a href="mailto:Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org">Fol.Derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org</a></p> <p>The telephone number is: 01332 888777</p> <p>Derby Homes website request form found at: <a href="https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5">https://www.derbyhomes.org/forms/default.aspx?formid=5</a></p>
<p>9) Does the council collect any information on a) how caravan dwellers are accessing electricity and b) which electrical items they are using? If so, please share details.</p>	<p>Information not held</p>
<p>10) Into the remit of which ...</p> <p>a) councillor/s and</p> <p>b) officer/s does the wellbeing and safety of caravan dwellers fall?</p>	<p>Housing – Cllr Shiraz Khan</p> <p>Childrens – Cllr Paul Hezelgrave</p> <p>Adults and Health – Cllr Alison Martin</p> <p>Public Protection – Cllr Onuoha</p> <p>Housing – Clare Mehrbani</p> <p>Childrens – Andy Appleyard</p> <p>Adults and Health – Suanne Lim and Robyn Dewis</p> <p>Public Protection – Simon Aitken</p>

**Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or other officers) names.**

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For more information follow this Link [www.ico.org.uk](http://www.ico.org.uk)

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any media and expressly does not constitute a 'soft opt-in' under PECR.

