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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI327653997  

Date 01/07/2025 

 
 

Information Requested Response  

In this request, “children” refers to those aged 0-18, rather than the whole age 

range covered by Education, Health and Care Plans. This is to try and keep the 

request aligned with housing department record-keeping. 

1.      Please state the number of 

children currently living in 

households housed in temporary 

accommodation outside your 

local authority area 

Information not held 

2.      Of the figure in question 1, 

please state the number of 

children who are in receipt of an 

Education, Health and Care Plan 

(ECHP) from your local authority 

Information not held 

3.      Of the figure in question 2, 

please list the local authorities in 

which they are temporarily 

housed, and how many are 

housed in each local authority 

Information not held 

4.      Of the figure in question 2, 

please state the number of 

children who attend school within 

your local authority area (rather 

than in the local authority where 

they have been temporarily 

housed) 

Information not held 

5.      Of the figure in question 4, 

please state the number of 

children who receive home to 

school transport funded by your 

local authority 

0 
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6.      Of the figure in question 3, 

please state the number of 

children housed in each recipient 

local authority area who attend 

school within your local authority 

area (rather than in the local 

authority where they have been 

temporarily housed) 

Information not held 

7.      Of the figure in question 6, 

please state the number of 

children in each recipient local 

authority who receive home to 

school transport funded by your 

local authority 

0 

Questions 4 and 5 combine all children with ECHPs in out-of-area temporary 

accommodation, whereas questions 6 and 7 break these figures down by 

“recipient” local authority. 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

