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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI797340565 

Date 02/05/2025 

 

The request covered two Council service areas and the responses are as follows: 
 
Response 1: Public Protection Team 
 

Information Requested Public Protection Team – Arron Kirkham 

I am writing to request information under the 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding fly-

tipping offences between January 2022 and 

March 2025. Please provide the following 

details:  

The number of recorded fly-tipping incidents 

per year from January 2022 to February 2025-

broken down by month and year 

Month Year Total Requests Location 

January 2022 125 Urban 

February 2022 76 Urban 

March 2022 125 Urban 

April  2022 94 Urban 

May  2022 101 Urban 

June 2022 80 Urban 

July  2022 53 Urban 

August  2022 66 Urban 

September 2022 64 Urban 

October 2022 80 Urban 

November 2022 62 Urban 

December 2022 55 Urban 

January 2023 94 Urban 

February 2023 63 Urban 

March 2023 26 Urban 

April  2023 33 Urban 

May 2023 34 Urban 

June 2023 33 Urban 
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July  2023 37 Urban 

August 2023 25 Urban 

September 2023 41 Urban 

October 2023 72 Urban 

November 2023 49 Urban 

December 2023 61 Urban 

January 2024 101 Urban 

February 2024 50 Urban 

March  2024 94 Urban 

April  2024 68 Urban 

May 2024 112 Urban 

June 2024 42 Urban 

July 2024 40 Urban 

August 2024 27 Urban 

September 2024 27 Urban 

October 2024 18 Urban 

November 2024 18 Urban 

December 2024 25 Urban 

January 2025 113 Urban 

February  2025 72 Urban 
 

1.Age of offender  Information not held 

2. Gender of offender   We only know the gender of the offender if we issue a Fixed Penalty Notice. 

Total FPNS issued was 497 (Jan 2022 to February 2025) 

275 FPN issued to females 

222 FPNs issued to males.  
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3. A brief description of what took place (if 

possible). 

Reports of fly tipping are emailed through to the PPO Inbox and then passed to 

the PPOs to investigate. FPNs are issued if evidence is found. 

 

 

a. Actions taken (Fines, clean-up costs and 

prosecutions etc) 

2022 – 170 FPNs issued – 19 sent to legal for prosecution of non-payment. 

2023 – 117 FPNs issued – 17 sent to legal for prosecution of non-payment. 

2024 – 173 FPNS issued – 16 sent to legal for prosecution for non-payment. 

2025 – 37 FPNS issued – 6 sent to legal for prosecution for non-payment. 

b. Object fly-tipped (white goods, building 

waste, mattresses etc) 

Fridge/Freezer, Washing Machines, Sofas, Mattresses, cardboard boxes, 

household furniture and black bags full of rubbish. 

c. Location (Urban, Rural, Layby, National Park 

etc) 

Urban 

 
Response 2: Environmental Protection Team 
 

Information Requested Environmental Protection Team 

I am writing to request information under the Freedom 

of Information Act 2000 regarding fly-tipping offences 

between January 2022 and March 2025. Please 

provide the following details:  

Month Year Total Requests  Location 

Jan-22 2022 8 Urban 

Feb-22 2022 15 Urban 

Mar-22 2022 33 Urban 

Apr-22 2022 24 Urban 

May-22 2022 25 Urban 
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The number of recorded fly-tipping incidents per year 

from January 2022 to February 2025-broken down by 

month and year 

Jun-22 2022 14 Urban 

Jul-22 2022 16 Urban 

Aug-22 2022 15 Urban 

Sep-22 2022 6 Urban 

Oct-22 2022 12 Urban 

Nov-22 2022 8 Urban 

Dec-22 2022 7 Urban 

Jan-23 2023 8 Urban 

Feb-23 2023 14 Urban 

Mar-23 2023 7 Urban 

Apr-23 2023 7 Urban 

May-23 2023 10 Urban 

Jun-23 2023 13 Urban 

Jul-23 2023 13 Urban 

Aug-23 2023 9 Urban 

Sep-23 2023 6 Urban 

Oct-23 2023 13 Urban 

Nov-23 2023 6 Urban 

Dec-23 2023 7 Urban 

Jan-24 2024 18 Urban 

Feb-24 2024 13 Urban 

Mar-24 2024 8 Urban 

Apr-24 2024 7 Urban 

May-24 2024 11 Urban 

Jun-24 2024 13 Urban 

Jul-24 2024 16 Urban 

Aug-24 2024 6 Urban 

Sep-24 2024 10 Urban 
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Oct-24 2024 13 Urban 

Nov-24 2024 4 Urban 

Dec-24 2024 8 Urban 

Jan-25 2025 14 Urban 
 

1.Age of offender Information not held 

2. Gender of offender   Information not held unless FPN served or prosecution action taken. 

For FPN’s issued gender: 

Male – 10 

Female – 7 

Unknown 2 

3. A brief description of what took place (if possible). The Environmental Protection Team investigate incidents of fly tipping on 

private land, or in the public domain where further investigation is require 

such as when CCTV obtained, or vehicle registration plate identified.  

Each case is allocated to an officer, investigated and action taken as 

appropriate. 

a. Actions taken (Fines, clean-up costs and 

prosecutions etc) 

19 Fixed Penalty notices (FPN’s) served. 

8 legal notices served for clearance of waste, 4 carried out works in 

default at a cost of £2757 for clearance 

b. Object fly-tipped (white goods, building waste, 

mattresses etc) 

Objects fly tipped include bagged and loose food waste and domestic 

waste, chairs, settees, builders waste, bikes, mattresses, garden waste. 

c. Location (Urban, Rural, Layby, National Park etc) Urban 
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Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council officers (or other officers) provided for direct 

marketing, you need to be registered with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You must also 

check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference 

Services to prevent Direct Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you comply with the 

Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and contact details under FOI does not give consent 

to receive direct marketing via any media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

