Derby City Council — Response

ID Reference FOI048211891

Date 24/03/2025

Information Requested

Response

1.Please provide the total number
of recorded road traffic accidents
in the UK (Scotland, England,
Wales, North Ireland) from
January 2024 to February 2025.
Additionally, identify which month
had the highest number of
incidents.

Data not held

The request relates to national data that is
held and collated by the Government.

The data is publicly available but is currently
not provided for the period requested.

Please visit www.gov.uk for further details and
contact roadacc.stats@dft.gov.uk for advice
and support.

2.Break down these accidents by
severity, categorising them into
fatal, serious, and slight injuries

Data not held

3.Provide a dataset detailing the
number of road traffic accidents
involving pedestrians, cyclists,
scooters, and motorcyclists
during this period.

Data not held

4. What were the leading causes
of road traffic accidents in the
given timeframe? Please include
a statistical breakdown by
category, such as speeding,
drink-driving, reckless driving,
poor weather conditions, vehicle
defects, and driver distraction
(e.g., mobile phone use).

Data not held

5.How many of these accidents
involved drivers aged under 25
years old or over 70 years old? If
available, please indicate any

Data not held
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trends or patterns related to these
age groups.

6.ldentify the most hazardous Data not held
roads and junctions based on
accident frequency during this
period, along with the total
number of incidents recorded at
each location.

7.Provide a ranked list of UK Data not held
cities and regions with the highest
number of traffic accidents,
specifying the recorded figures
for each.

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or
other officers) names.

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered
with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You
must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing
purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct
Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you
comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For
more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and
contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any
media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR.
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