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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI897230357 

Date 14/11/2024 

 
Please include the following information for the past five financial years. 
 

Information Requested Response  

1. Total spent by council on 

teaching recruitment agencies; 

Information not held 

Please use the schools contact details listed 

on our website to contact the schools direct for 

this information. 

2. List of all the teaching 

recruitment agencies that have 

been used including annual 

spend on each agency; 

Information not held 

Please use the schools contact details listed 

on our website to contact the schools direct for 

this information. 

3. Total number of shifts filled by 

staff supplied by teaching 

recruitment agencies; 

Information not held 

Please use the schools contact details listed 

on our website to contact the schools direct for 

this information. 

4. The highest per hour and per 

day rate paid to recruitment 

teaching agencies in each 

financial year stated above. In 

each case, can you please detail 

the job category of the role 

provided. And if there was surge 

pricing, the reason stated for this. 

Information not held 

Please use the schools contact details listed 

on our website to contact the schools direct for 

this information. 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 
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comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

