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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI894519714 

Date 29/10/2024 

 
 

Information Requested Response  

1.      How many children and 
young adults (including children 
looked after, care leavers and 
UASC) were placed in supported 
accommodation settings by the 
local authority on 31st March in 
the following years (31 March 
2021, 31 March 2022, 31 March 
2023, 31 March 2024)?  Please 
could you also provide this 
information for those aged 16-17 
and 18+ split by the amount of 
weekly support hours 
commissioned? 
 
16 & 17 year olds 
 
1-6 hours        
7-12 hours       
13-18 hours     
19-24 hours      
25-48 hours     
49-72 hours      
73-96 hours      
96-167 hours     
168 hours (24/7 placements)     
Other placements   
Total 16- & 17-year-olds         
 
18+ year olds 
 
1-6 hours        
7-12 hours       
13-18 hours     
19-24 hours      
25-48 hours      
49-72 hours      
73-96 hours      
96-167 hours     
168 hours (24/7 placements)   
Other placements      

Information held cannot be split by number of 

support hours. 

31/03/21 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/21: 32 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/21: Information not 

held 

31/03/22 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/22: 40 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/22: Information not 

held 

31/03/23 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/23: 47 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/23: Information not 

held 

31/03/24 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/24: 60 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation on 31/03/24: Information not 

held 
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Total 18+ year olds     
Total placements     
 

2.      How many children and 
young adults (including children 
looked after, care leavers and 
UASC) were placed in supported 
accommodation settings by the 
local authority during the year 
from 1st April to 31st March in the 
following years, 2021,  2022, 
2023, 2024)? Please could you 
also provide this information for 
those aged 16-17 and 18+ split 
by the amount of weekly support 
hours commissioned?: 
 
16 & 17 year olds 
1-6 hours        
7-12 hours   
13-18 hours    
19-24 hours    
25-48 hours    
49-72 hours    
73-96 hours     
96-167 hours    
168 hours (24/7 placements)     
Other placements         
Total 16- & 17-year-olds        
 
18+ year olds 
1-6 hours    
7-12 hours      
13-18 hours   
19-24 hours    
25-48 hours      
49-72 hours    
73-96 hours     
96-167 hours    
168 hours (24/7 placements)     
Other placements      
Total 18+ year olds     
Total placements      
 

Information held cannot be split by number of 

support hours. 

01/04/20 to 31/03/21 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation from 01/04/20 to 31/03/21: 63 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation 01/04/20 to 31/03/21: 

Information not held 

01/04/21 to 31/03/22 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation from 01/04/21 to 31/03/22: 72 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation 01/04/21 to 31/03/22: 

Information not held 

01/04/22 to 31/03/23 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation from 01/04/22 to 31/03/23: 84 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation 01/04/22 to 31/03/23: 

Information not held 

01/04/23 to 31/03/24 

Total 16/17 year olds in supported 

accommodation from 01/04/23 to 31/03/24: 72 

Total 18+ year olds in supported 

accommodation 01/04/23 to 31/03/24: 

Information not held 

3.      In relation to any 
Frameworks you currently 
operate for Supported 
Accommodation, please provide 
the following information 
(including Provider name) about 

D2N2 Supported Accommodation 

Framework 

ANEW Young People Services Ltd 



 

Page 3 of 9 
 

the number of YP placed, the 
average hourly rate paid for these 
placements, hours provisioned a 
week, per age bracket and 
commentary around any 
applicable discounts agreed with 
said Provider. 
 
Provider and the below details 
listed on a per provider basis: 
- No of placements 16-17 yrs old 
- Hourly rate of 16-17 yr old 
- Av hours a week for 16-17 yr old 
- No of placements 18+ yrs old 
- Hourly rate of 18+ yr old 
- Av hours a week for 18+ yr old 
- Discounts agreed 

16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 3 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 7 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 0 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Aspire Pathway Group 
 
16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 2 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 15 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 0 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Axiom Supported Living 
 
16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 2 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 15 

 
18+ Year Olds 
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• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 0 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Inicio Group 
 
16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 3 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £19.90 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 7 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 1 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £19.90 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 5 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Premier Healthcare Services Ltd 
 
16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 10 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 10 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 2 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 
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• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 10 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Serenity Housing 
 
16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 1 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £20 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 10 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 0 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 
Teen Support Services 

16/17 Year Olds 

• Number of current 16/17 year old 
placements: 2 

• Average hourly rate of current 16/17 
year old placements: £13.50 

• Average number of support hours 
commissioned a week for current 16/17 
year old placements: 7 

 
18+ Year Olds 
 

• Number of current 18+ year old 
placements: 0 

 
Discounts agreed: N/A 
 

4.      What is your total spend on 
supported accommodation 
placements by the local authority 
in the following financial years 
(2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23, 
2023/24)? Please could you also 

Information held cannot be split by age or 

number of support hours. 
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provide this information for those 
aged 16-17 and 18+. 
 
16 & 17 year olds 
 
1-6 hours        
7-12 hours       
13-18 hours      
19-24 hours      
25-48 hours      
49-72 hours      
73-96 hours      
96-167 hours    
168 hours (24/7 placements)    
Other placements        
Total 16- & 17-year-olds       
 
18+ year olds 
 
1-6 hours       
7-12 hours      
13-18 hours      
19-24 hours      
25-48 hours      
49-72 hours      
73-96 hours      
96-167 hours     
168 hours (24/7 placements)      
Other placements        
Total 18+ year olds    
Total placements        
 

• Total spend on supported 

accommodation in 2020/21: 

£2,397,277.94 

 

• Total spend on supported 

accommodation in 2021/22: 

£2,155,141.41 

 

• Total spend on supported 

accommodation in 2022/23: 

£3,345,824.40 

 

• Total spend on supported 

accommodation in 2023/24: 

£3,349,978.00 

 

 

5.      Ofsted now requires 
supported accommodation 
providers to be registered and 
regulated for 16-17 placements. 
Of all the current 16-17 year olds 
in supported accommodation 
placements by the local authority, 
how many are placed with 
providers that have successfully 
registered with Ofsted? 
 

All of them. 

 

6.      Of all the current 16-17 year 
olds in supported accommodation 
placements by the local authority, 
how many are placed with 
providers that have not yet 

All are placed with providers that are Ofsted 

registered (i.e. are either fully registered or 

passed Stage 1 of the Ofsted registration 

process ahead of the 28/10/23 deadline). 
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successfully registered with 
Ofsted (split between those that 
you know to have applied for 
registration, those that you know 
not yet to have applied for 
registration, and those whose 
status is unknown)? 

7.      How many children and 
young adults (including children 
looked after, care leavers and 
UASC) currently placed, prior to 
their current Supported 
Accommodation setting came 
from either: other supported 
accommodation units; residential 
care; not in care; or other? 

Young people currently placed in supported 

accommodation were accommodated in the 

following settings prior to this: 

• 18 Were placed in other supported 

accommodation units 

• 4 Were placed in residential care 

• 32 Were not in care 

• 10 Other (foster care and placed with 

parents) 

 

8.      How many children and 
young adults (including children 
looked after, care leavers and 
UASC) that have left their 
Supported Accommodation unit 
during the year from 1st April 
2023 to 31st March 2024 have 
left to go to: other supported 
 

Number of young people who left their 

supported accommodation placement to go to 

other supported accommodation between 

01/04/23 to 31/03/24: 137 

 

9.      Of the children and young 
adults (including children looked 
after, care leavers and UASC) 
that have left a supported 
accommodation unit during the 
year from 1st April 2023 to 31st 
March 2024, please provide detail 
on the length of their placement – 
1 week, 2 weeks, 3 weeks, 4 
weeks, 5-12 weeks, 13-24 weeks, 
25-36 weeks, 37 weeks to 52 
weeks, 53 weeks and over. 
 

Number of young people who left their 

supported accommodation placement  

between 01/04/23 to 31/03/24 by length of 

their placement: 

• 1 Week: 5 

• 2 Weeks: 2 

• 3 Weeks: 3 

• 4 Weeks: 5 

• 5-12 Weeks: 33 

• 13-24 Weeks: 35 

• 25-36 Weeks: 23 

• 37-52 Weeks: 18 

• 53 Weeks and Over: 13 
 

10.     Of the children and young 
adults (including children looked 
after, care leavers and UASC) 
placed in supported 
accommodation, how many were 
placed within the local authority 

16/17 Year Olds 

Number of 16/17 year old young people 

currently in supported accommodation placed 
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and how many were placed in 
other local authorities?  Please 
provide this information split 
between 16-17 year olds and 
18+. 
 
 

within Derby City Council local authority 

boundary: 52 

Number of 16/17 year old young people 

currently in supported accommodation placed 

outside of Derby City Council local authority 

boundary: 12 

18+ Year Olds 

Number of 18+ year old young people 

currently in supported accommodation placed 

within Derby City Council local authority 

boundary: Information not held 

Number of 18+ year old young people 

currently in supported accommodation placed 

outside of Derby City Council local authority 

boundary: Information not held 

11.     Of the children and young 
adults placed in supported 
accommodation, how many 
would form part of the UASC 
cohort? Please provide this 
information split between 16-17 
year olds and 18+ and for the 
years 2021, 2022, 2023 and 
2024. Please also provide the 
expected growth trend in the 
UASC population that are 
expected to be placed in 
Supported Accommodation. 
 

2021 

16/17 Year Olds 

Number of 16/17 year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: 21 

18+ Year Olds 

Number of 18+ year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: Information not held 

2022 

16/17 Year Olds 

Number of 16/17 year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: 26 

18+ Year Olds 

Number of 18+ year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: Information not held 

2023 

16/17 Year Olds 



 

Page 9 of 9 
 

Number of 16/17 year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: 36 

18+ Year Olds 

Number of 18+ year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: Information not held 

2024 

16/17 Year Olds 

Number of 16/17 year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: 29 

18+ Year Olds 

Number of 18+ year old UASCs in supported 

accommodation: Information not held 

Expected growth trend in UASC population 

expected to be placed in supported 

accommodation:  Do not have this 

information. 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

