Derby City Council — Response

ID Reference FOI654068369

Date 14/10/2024

Information Requested Response

I would like information about the Respect Collaboration of schools (and it's
former name The Kingsmead School).

Request Time Period: 1/9/2018 to 29/7/2024

The information | am requesting is as follows:

1. How much money has the Information not held
Executive Headteacher (Mike
Pride) spent on "re-branding” the
school since he started in the
post? l.WOU|d like to know about The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
everything related to the rebrands Referral Unit (PRU)

(two of them namely his
RESPECT vision and also the The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
name change from Kingsmead to |[DE1 3LB

RCo0S). This will include hiring
designers/ consultants, paying for [Phone - 01332 973830
signage and changes to the
website, paperwork, other decals
etc. | would also like confirmation
of the source of the money spent,
ie did it come from the school
budget or was it from another
funding source?

Please contact the school direct for the
information:

2. How much is the cost of hiring (Information not held
offices in Pride Park (the work

place of the leadership team)? Please contact the school direct for the

information:

The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
Referral Unit (PRU)

The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
DE1 3LB
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Phone - 01332 973830

3. What is the percentage of staff
turnover since Mike Pride
became the Executive
Headteacher?

Information not held

Please contact the school direct for the
information:

The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
Referral Unit (PRU

The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
DE1 3LB

Phone - 01332 973830

4. How many staff, on leaving
employment at the school, have
signed some sort of restriction
related to taking further action
against the school after leaving,
in the last 5 years?

Information not held

Please contact the school direct for the
information:

The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
Referral Unit (PRU

The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
DE1 3LB

Phone - 01332 973830

5. How many incidents of peer
on peer assault occurred at the
school in the last 2 years?

Information not held

Please contact the school direct for the
information:

The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
Referral Unit (PRU)

The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
DE1 3LB

Phone - 01332 973830

6. How many incidents have
there been of staff discipline in
the last 4 years? By this is mean
staff who have been processed
through the following policies:
attendance, grievance,
competence, bullying or staff that

Information not held

Please contact the school direct for the
information:

The Kingsmead School - Secondary and Pupil
Referral Unit (PRU)
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have been through a disciplinary [The Kingsmead School, Bridge Street, Derby,
procedure related to their work.  |[PE1 3LB

Phone - 01332 973830

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or
other officers) names.

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered
with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You
must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing
purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct
Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you
comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For
more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and
contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any
media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR.
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