Derby City Council — Response

ID Reference FOI350670221

Date 19/09/2024

Information Requested

Response

1. How many home educated
children does your LA currently
have recorded?

As at 17 September 2024

647

2. How many households do
these children come from?

Information not held

3. In the last 12 months how
many s437(1) formal notices to
satisfy have you served on
parents regarding home educated
children?

None

4. How many School Attendance
Orders (SAOSs) (attendance order
in Scotland) have been served on
children that were known to be
home educated until the SAO
was served?

None

5. What was the outcome of each
SAQO? (for example, prosecuted
for non compliance (please
explain the outcome from court),
revoked (please explain why the
SAO was revoked). )

Information not held

6. How many children do you
have recorded as a Child Missing
Education (CME) that are not
subject to S437(1) or SAO?

61

7. In the last 12 months, what is
the range of time period between
a parent requesting the LA
provide a school place and the
child starting at the school? (for

Information not held
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example a home educated child
that wishes to go to school, or a
family has moved to the area and
wants a school place).

8. In the period of time, between |None
the parental request and the
initial start date at school, has the
LA put in place education for the
child under s19 Education Act?

9. If s19 is provided, how many  We put in place 18 hours + PSD and
hours education per week are put ftherapies.
in place?

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or
other officers) names.

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered
with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You
must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing
purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct
Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you
comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For
more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and
contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any
media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR.
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