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Derby City Council – Response Public Protection Team 

ID Reference FOI028789977 

Date 16/09/2024 

 
 

Information 

Requested 

Public Protection 

Team  

Environmental 

Protection Team 

Street cleaning  

1. How many 

incidents of fly 

tipping have been 

reported each 

year for 2021, 

2022, 2023 and 

2024 (to date). 

Please 

breakdown the 

number of 

incidents by 

month where 

possible to 

highlight which 

months are most 

common for fly 

tipping / have the 

highest number of 

fly tipping 

incidents? 

Please see 

attached  

document. 

Please see 

attached 

spreadsheet 

response. 

Please see attached file 

showing a breakdown of 

fly-tippling instances 

reported to us from 2021 

to date. 

2.  In total, how 

much has been 

paid to 

remove/clean up 

following fly 

tipping each year 

in 2021, 2022, 

2023 and 2024 (to 

date) 

 Information not 

held. 

Information not 

held – please see 

street cleaning 

response  

2021 – £327,226  

2022 – £321,778  

2023 – £294,417  

2024 - £161,444 (Jan – 

June only)  

Please note that the 

above are approximate 

costs for the removal of 

all fly tipping, this 

includes instances which 

are reported to us and 
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instances the team have 

seen and proactively 

removed. These are 

approximate costs, using 

a national pricing 

calculator based on the 

quantity and waste type 

of the fly-tipping 

collected.  

3. How many fly 

tipping fines have 

been given out in 

the years of: 

2021, 2022, 2023 

and 2024 (to 

date) 

2021 – 54 Fines 

issued 

2022 – 107 fines 

issued 

2023 – 53 fines 

issued 

2024 – 44 fines 

issued to date 

Please see 

attached 

spreadsheet 

response. 

Information not held – 

please see Public 

Protection/Environmental 

Team response. 

4.  How much 

money has been 

paid in fly tipping 

fines in the years 

of: 2021, 2022, 

2023 and 2024 (to 

date) 

2021 - £8250.00 

2022 – £18865.00 

2023 - £7646.00 

2024 - £7335.00 to 

date 

2021 - £750 

2022 - £750 

2023 - £500 

2024 to date - 

£610 

 

Information not held – 

please see Public 

Protection/Environmental 

Team response. 

5. Have you 

recently increased 

fly tipping fines? If 

yes, please can 

you tell us how 

much you fine for 

fly tipping now 

(current date) 

versus 

previously? 

Current Fly Tipping 

fine £360.00 

Previous fine 

amount £250.00 

Yes, 

Previous £250 if 

paid in 10 days, 

£400 if paid in14 

days. 

Now £360 if paid in 

10 days, £600 if 

paid in14 days 

The Fly tipping amount 

was £400.00 with an 

early payment of 

£250.00. Amounts are 

now £600 and £360 for 

early repayment. 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 
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If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

