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1.The average annualised cost of 

a permanent full-time placement 

at Castle School for the school 

year 23/34. 

Children placed at Castle School with an EHC 

plan are funded via £10,000 in place funding 

for 45 children and a further £18,020.60 per 

child. 

2.The range of costs of the 

placements (where there are 

different costs for each pupil) for 

the school year 23/24. 

Each child placed with an EHC plan is funded 

in the same way. No children at the setting 

receive any further, exceptional funding 

3.How many of the children on 

roll at Castle School have EHCPs 

naming Castle School for the 

school year 23/24. 

36 

4.How many different children 

had temporary placements at 

Castle School (ie not permanently 

on roll or named on EHCP) in 

Autumn term 2023 

1 

5.How many children are 

permanently on roll solely at 

Castle School in years 7, 8, 9, 10 

and 11 (ie not shared placement 

with original secondary school or 

attending Kingsmead School) for 

the school year 23/24 

Year 7 - 2  

Year 8 - 2  

Year 9 - 3  

Year 10 - 9  

Year 11 - 20 

6.Children’s attendance 

percentage solely at Castle 

School in years 7, 8, 9, 10 and 11 

(ie not shared placement with 

original secondary school or 

attending Kingsmead School) for 

the school year 23/24. 

Data not held by the local authority 
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7.How many qualified PE 

teachers the school employs (full 

time equivalent - so if only 

employed 1 day a week, that 

would be 0.2) and what PE 

curriculum the school offered for 

Autumn term 2023. 

Information not held by the local authority. 

8.What the average attendance 

was for pupils on roll at Castle 

School as a whole, and 

separately for each year 7, 8, 9, 

10 and 11 for the Autumn term 

2023. 

Data not held by the local authority 

9.How many of the children 

attending Castle School arrive by 

taxi transport funded by the Local 

Authority and how many arrive by 

public transport (bus) funded by 

the Local Authority (as a 

percentage). 

10 Children have home to school travel 

arranged by the local authority through a taxi 

provider 

 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or 

other officers) names. 

If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council 

officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered 

with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You 

must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing 

purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct 

Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you 

comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For 

more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and 

contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any 

media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 
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