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Derby City Council – Response 

ID Reference FOI694465113 

Date 08/09/2023 

 
This is a request under the Freedom of Information Act and concerns the details of any or all Local Authority Trading Companies (LATCs) 
under the part or whole ownership of your Local Authority. 
 

1.Please confirm if the Local 

Authority includes any Local 

Authority Trading Companies 

(LATC’s) 

Yes. 

2.If yes, then: 

a.Please confirm the LATC name and company details for each and every LATC – please see table below 

b.Please confirm the supplier 

payment performance for each 

LATC: 

Information not held – please contact the respective organisation listed for the 

information. 

i.% (volume) of invoices paid 

within 30 days 

Information not held – please contact the respective organisation listed for the 

information. 

ii.% (volume) of invoices paid 

later than agreed terms 

Information not held – please contact the respective organisation listed for the 

information. 
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Arms length organisations/ trading 
companies belonging to council 

Principal 
activity 

Wholly-
owned? 

Y/N 

Jointly-
owned? 

Y/N 

Other owners if 
relevant 

Year 
founded 

Email address for direct FoI 
requests 

Derby Homes Ltd 

Management 
& 
maintenance 
of the 
Council's 
social 
housing 
stock Y N N/A 2002 foi.derbyhomes@derbyhomes.org  

Scape Group Limited Procurement     N Y 

Derbyshire County 
Council, Nottingham 
City Council, 
Nottinghamshire 
County Council, 
Warwickshire County 
Council, Gateshead 
Metropolitan Borough 
Council.  2005 general@scape.co.uk  

Derbyshire Building Control 
Partnership 

Building 
Control N Y 

Amber Valley BC, 
Bolsover DC, 

Chesterfield BC, 
Derbyshire Dales DC, 
High Peak BC, North 
East Derbyshire DC, 

Staffordshire 
Moorlands DC. 2015 neil.johnson@dbcp.co.uk  

 
 
 
 

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or other officers) names. 

mailto:general@scape.co.uk
mailto:neil.johnson@dbcp.co.uk
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If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council officers (or other officers) provided for direct 

marketing, you need to be registered with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You must also 

check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference 

Services to prevent Direct Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you comply with the 

Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk 

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and contact details under FOI does not give consent 

to receive direct marketing via any media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR. 

 

http://www.ico.org.uk/

