Derby City Council — Response

ID Reference FOI520716826

Date 24/07/2023

Pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act 2000 and CPR 31.16, please

provide copies of: -

1. Tree maintenance records for
the area DE21 2** since 2008;

Information not held

2. Confirmation of any other
complaints or claims from
residents regarding vegetation
within a 1 mile radius of 12
Cherrybrook Drive, Oakwood,
Derby, DE21 2SH since 2008;

Information not held.

3. Any technical or engineering
evidence, reports or opinion
obtained in respect of item 2
above;

Information not held.

No records held of an engineering or technical
nature relating to vegetation within 1 mile of
DE21 2SH.

4. Subsidence risk management
plans for the area DE21 2** since
2008;

Information not held.

5. Details of and dates of any tree
removal and the reasons for
removal within a 1 mile radius of
12 Cherrybrook Drive, Oakwood,
Derby, DE21 2SH since 2008;

Please see attached Spreadsheet which lists
trees felled within Derwent and Chaddesden
wards. Data cannot be filtered to within 1 mile
radius of DE21 2SH.

Reasons for felling - information not held.

6. Evidence of any recorded or
reported hotspots or problem
areas within a 1 mile radius of 12
Cherrybrook Drive, Oakwood,
Derby, DE21 2SH since 2008.

Information not held.

Please note, the following applies, if the response includes council officers (or

other officers) names.
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If you are a company that intends to use the names and contact details of council
officers (or other officers) provided for direct marketing, you need to be registered
with the Information Commissioner to process personal data for this purpose. You
must also check that the individual (whom you wish to contact for direct marketing
purposes) is not registered with one of the Preference Services to prevent Direct
Marketing. If they are you must adhere to this preference. You must also ensure you
comply with the Privacy Electronic and Communications Regulations (PECR). For
more information follow this Link www.ico.org.uk

For the avoidance of doubt the provision of council (and other) officer names and
contact details under FOI does not give consent to receive direct marketing via any
media and expressly does not constitute a ‘soft opt-in’ under PECR.
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